
 2025 PRE-BUSINESS MENTORS 

 

BROOKS ALLEN 
Hello! My name is Brooks Allen and I am a junior from Marin County, California. I am an honors student 
at Leeds pursuing a dual degree both business (Finance and Accounting) and in philosophy through the 
Arts & Sciences department. Here at CU I am a member of the Kappa Sigma fraternity. I enjoy anything 
outdoors, basketball, running, lifting and most other activities. I look forward to talking with you! 

 

PHOEBE ALTENBURG 
Hi! I’m Phoebe Altenburg, and I’m currently a sophomore at Leeds. I was in the pre-business program 
during my freshman year. I’m from Cape Elizabeth, Maine. I love to ski, work out, go to concerts, spend 
time at the beach, hang out with friends, shop, bake, and so much more! I am currently a member in 
Delta Gamma and Women in Business. 

 

RACHEL BARRY 
Hi, I'm Rachel! I was a Pre-Business student last year, now a Sophomore in Leeds, hoping to pursue a 
degree in Business Administration with an emphasis in Human Resource Management. I'm also minoring 
in Spanish! I am a member of Chi Omega and involved on campus in groups such as Women in Business 
and CU Ladies Golf Club. I enjoy spending time with family and friends, taking exercise classes, traveling, 
going out for food/coffee, and trying new things. I'm from out of state (Kalamazoo, Michigan), and am 
passionate about easing the college transition for other students and helping them take advantage of all 
the incredible opportunities Boulder has to offer! Looking forward to connecting with you and sharing 
my tips & tricks from my experience here so far! 

 

IVY BOOCKVAR 
My name is Ivy Boockvar and I am from Scarsdale, New York. I am interested in majoring in marketing 
and possibly going into sports marketing. I have played sports all of my life; I played basketball, soccer, 
and flag football in high school and it is a huge part of me. I want to study this to help continue my love 
for sports. I am in the Pi Beta Phi sorority and I love to hang out with friends, travel, exercise, cook, play 
sports, and listen to music. 

 

AVA CALIGARIS 
Hi! My name is Ava! I am from the Bay Area, CA and a sophomore here at CU! I was a Pre-business 
student last year and am now in Leeds hoping to pursue an emphasis in marketing and working on a 
minor in political science. I am in Kappa Alpha Theta and work as a community assistant in Andrew's 
Hall. I love hiking, listening to music, being with friends, watching true crime, hanging out with my dogs 
and dancing! 

 

CONNOR CORNELL 
Hi! My name is Connor Cornell, and I’m a sophomore at the Leeds School of Business, majoring in 
Finance and Accounting. I’m an active member of the Leeds Investment Banking Club and the Leeds 
Investment & Trading Group, where I’ve developed my financial modeling and valuation skills through 
hands-on projects, including a deep dive into YETI Holdings Inc. Through these experiences, I’ve gained 
exposure to DCF modeling, comparable company analysis, and market trend research. Outside the 
classroom, I have interned in manufacturing and sales, gaining valuable experience in business 
operations, customer relations, and financial analysis. I’ve also worked as a Statistics UCA at CU Boulder, 
where I tutored students and strengthened my ability to break down complex topics into digestible 
concepts. I previously participated in the Leeds Young Alumni Mentoring Program, where I connected 
with investment banking professionals to refine my technical skills and career strategy. Now, I’m excited 
to give back as a Peer-to-Peer Mentor by helping students navigate their academic and career journeys. 
Whether it’s resume-building, interview prep, or course guidance, I’m happy to share what I’ve learned 
and help others succeed at Leeds! In my free time, I enjoy snowboarding, lifting, hiking, and playing 
music. Looking forward to meeting and working with fellow Leeds students! 
 

 

LIAM DALZELL 
My name is Liam Dalzell, and I am currently a Sophomore within the Leeds School of Business, studying 
Accounting and Finance. I am a part of four clubs: the Leeds Investment Banking Club, Leeds Student 
Government, TAMID, the University of Colorado Boulder Waterski Club. I grew up in the suburbs of 
Chicago before moving up to Summit County, Colorado, halfway through my freshman year of high 



school. In high school, I was a three-sport athlete, where I alpine ski raced, ran track, and ran cross 
country. When it came time to apply to colleges, I only applied to one, the University of Colorado 
Boulder. Next year, as a Junior, I plan on studying abroad in Ireland for my Spring semester. I am a 
relatively adventurous person and will very rarely turn down a thrill-seeking event. 

 

JAMESON DAVIS 
Hi my name is Jameson Davis and I am a current Leeds Business school student. I am from the small 
town of Evergreen, Colorado 45 minutes away from Boulder. I really believe that mentorship programs 
such as this are very important for the success of everyone. I know for a fact I have had a fair share of 
challenges, and it is helpful to have someone to talk it though, and possibly relate to you. I enjoy being 
outside, playing basketball, and hanging out with friends. I will do everything in my power to improve 
your experience here at Boulder. 

 
 

TYLAR DILLON 
My name is Tylar Dillon, I am from Connecticut originally and moved to Denver during my sophomore 
year of high school. I love to travel, be outside, go to concerts, and have fun. I was a pre-business my 
freshman year so I understand the stress and the anxiety of making certain requirements and doing well 
in the mandatory classes. I am in a sorority as well as a member of the Woman in the Business Club so I 
know how to balance academics with social life. I would love to give any advice or insight, just as my 
mentor did for me. 

 

 

LAYDA ESTRADA 
Hello, my name is Layda Estrada and I am from Austin Texas. I am studying Business Analytics and plan 
on pursuing a career in Data Analytics and or Financial Technologies after college. Some of my favorite 
things I like to do on my free time consist of reading, working out, hiking the Flatirons, and going to 
coffee shops. 

 
 

ZOE GARDNER 
Hi! I'm Zoe Gardner and I'm from Thornton, CO. I'm pursuing my emphasis in marketing and potentially 
looking at the personal financial planning track. I'm involved in a social sorority Delta Gamma as well as 
the business fraternity Delta Sigma Pi and I like to play intramural soccer when I can. I love going to 
concerts, finding new restaurants to try, and thrifting. 

 

JILL GIDDENS 
Hi! I’m Jill and I am going to be a junior at Leeds in the fall 2025 semester. I was a Pre-Business student 
freshman year and I’m studying Accounting and Social Responsibility & Sustainability and plan to 
complete the BAM program to earn my CPA certification. I am part of the Sustainable Business Club and 
Beta Alpha Psi here at Leeds and would love to help you find what you love to do in business! Outside of 
school, I like watching CU sports, crafting, being with friends, and snowboarding. I can’t wait to help you 
with your journey at Leeds and love your time at CU! 

 
 

KONRAD HONG-BU 
Hi! My name is Konrad, and I'm studying finance and accounting. I'm from Denver, CO, but I love the 
West Coast. Outside of school, I enjoy watching football and basketball, playing tennis, and working out. 

 

QUINN HUDELSON 
My name is Quinn and I am a sophomore dual emphasizing in finance and accounting with a minor in 
economics. I grew up in Greenwood Village, Colorado and have lived here my whole life. In high school I 
was the captain of the Varsity Basketball and Tennis teams, and competed in DECA. I like to hangout with 
my friends and family as well as spend time outside. At CU, I am a member of Beta Alpha Psi – the 
accounting and finance honors society and play intramural basketball and pickleball. 

 

 

NOAH KERNS 
My name is Noah Kerns. I'm from the Bay Area in California. I am pursuing a Finance and Accounting 
emphasis within Leeds Business School. I love to workout, snowboard, and socialize. Since coming to CU 
I have made great friends, found fantastic clubs, and really enjoyed my time here with everything 
Boulder has to offer. I love connecting with people and helping others get connected. 



 ANISHA KESHAVDAS 
Hi my name is Anisha!  I'm from the Bay Area and I'm emphasizing in marketing. In my free time, I love 
spending time with my friends and family, playing tennis, shopping, skiing, and I always love an 
adventure. At CU I'm involved in South Asian Student Association, Women in Business, Multicultural 
Leadership Scholars, and CU American Marketing Association.  I'm participating in FGX and am super 
excited to be going to Paris in the summer with Leeds. I am excited about all of the new opportunities 
and experiences, as well as the upcoming school year! 

 

MAYA LAWRENCE 
Hello!! My name is Maya Lawrence and I'm from Seattle, Washington. I am pursuing a degree in 
Business Administration with an emphasis in Accounting at Leeds. I was originally Pre-Business, and am 
a part of the Women in Business Club, Best Buddies Club, and Pi Beta Phi Sorority! Outside of school I 
love to travel, workout, ski, and hangout with friends in my free time. 

 

HALEY LORCH 
Hi! My name is Haley and I am from Louisville, Kentucky! I am a marketing major with a leadership 
minor. I transferred into Leeds my sophomore year – but was in pre business my freshman year. I can 
definitely relate to the stress of transferring in late as well as dealing with the workload that comes with 
being in pre business. I am into traveling, hiking, reading, and skiing . I can't wait to learn more about 
you! 

 

EMIKO MASAMORI 
Hi! My name is Emiko, and I’m from the Bay Area in California. I started out in Pre-Business during my 
first year at CU Boulder, and I’m now pursuing a double emphasis in Management and Entrepreneurship 
(Leadership track) and Marketing at the Leeds School of Business. Outside of school, I love going to 
concerts, spending time with friends, being outdoors, hanging out with my pets and family, and going on 
road trips! 

 
 

PRARTHANA MATHAD 
Hi, I'm Prarthana! I'm from Colorado Springs and began my Leeds journey through the Pre-Business 
Program! I'm dual emphasizing in Business Analytics and Management while also completing a 
Leadership Studies Minor. At CU, I'm involved in Delta Sigma Pi, The Women's Network and Women in 
Business. In my free time I love to hang out with my friends, hike, listen to music, and read. I was just a 
freshman, so I know how hard it can be to find resources and support in this new environment. I hope to 
make mentees feel more at home at CU! 

 

OWEN MCVICKER  
I'm a junior in Leeds dual-emphasizing in finance and accounting. A few clubs that I am involved with on 
campus are Buffs on Wallstreet, Leeds Association for Information Systems (LAIS), and Scholars of 
Finance. Outside of class, I enjoy spending time with friends, playing basketball, working out, and hiking. 
I’m outgoing and highly motivated by challenging tasks, but I also love to have a good time outside of 
the classroom with my friends. I have prior experience in corporate development, private equity, and 
investment banking. 

 

NIAMH PIFFARERIO 
Hi! I'm Niamh Piffarerio and was a pre-business student now a junior in Leeds. I am studying finance, as 
well as pursuing a minor in International Affairs. I am a CO native but have been traveling to Ireland to 
visit my family every year since I was born. I was part of the Women in Business club run by Leeds 
businesswomen and love taking care of my Pothos and ivy plants. My favorite flower is an orchid and my 
favorite color is pink :) 

 

AMALIA SANMILLIAN 
Hello!! My name is Amalia Sanmillan and I was born in Vitoria, Spain but grew up in Highlands Ranch, 
CO. I have lived in Colorado now for 12 years. I love to travel, ski, workout, and hang out with friends. I 
like working and interacting with others and helping in any way that I can. My ideal day is waking up 
around 9:30, eating a good breakfast and getting outside, then I would want to go hang out with friends 
and end up going out at night. Breakfast is my favorite meal of the day and pasta (especially spicy pasta) 
is my favorite food. My worst fear is moths, but I love horses. 



 

TAYLOR SAVILLE 
Hi! I’m Taylor Saville, originally from Richmond, VA, but now living in Denver. I’m a Finance major with a 
minor in International Affairs. Some of my favorite places I’ve traveled to are Morocco and France, and I 
hope to study abroad while at CU. Outside of academics, I love skiing, going to concerts at Red Rocks 
with my friends, and exploring new coffee shops. At Leeds, I’m involved in Women in Business and the 
Honors Program, and I became a Leeds Mentor because I want to help other students find their place in 
Leeds. My goal is to pursue a career in international business, and I am excited to connect with my 
mentee and help them make the most of their experience at CU! 

 

NEVE WADE 
Hey, I’m Neve Wade, and I'm from Steamboat Springs, CO! While at Boulder, I plan to pursue a career in 
finance. I am passionate about helping others grow and succeed. I started in Pre-business and am a part 
of Women in Business and Chi Omega Sorority! Outside of academics, I love spending time outdoors, 
whether skiing, wake surfing, horseback riding, hiking, or exploring new adventures. 

 


